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The stage is all set to 
celebrate the opening 
of the new Your 
Discount Chemist 
superstore.
There will be sam-
ples, savings and 
prizes galore. 
Discover what you 
could win in the 
pages inside.
The new store is 
open seven days a 
week, from 8.30am 
to 6pm on Mondays 
to Fridays, 9am to 
3pm on Saturdays 
and 9am to 1pm on 
Sundays.

Opening celebrations for Your Discount Chemist this Saturday

GETTING READY: Fawaz and Said Khodary in the new superstore now located at Shop 1, 85 Bold Street, Laurieton.

Bigger and better
A VAST improvement in 
pharmaceutical services is 
happening in Laurieton. 

The new Your Discount 
Chemist superstore is now 
open and you are invited to 
join in the special celebra-
tions on Saturday, May 26,

The Your Discount Team 
have already been in Laurie-
ton for 11 years and opening 
this new store is all about 
enhancing the shopping ex-
perience by giving customers 
more choice and the room to 

browse in comfort.
Everything is now easier 

to see.
You’ll find the same val-

ue-for-money prices as 
they’ve always had, as well 
as familiar friendly faces. 
Plus they have employed 
five new locals to join their 
30-strong team.

It has been a huge in-
vestment in the town by the 
Khodary brothers, who will 
offer now be able to offer a 
larger range of products than 

ever before. 
Among the range are the 

top nine cosmetic brands 
including Revlon, May-
belline, L’Oreal, Natio and 
Max Factor.

Your Discount Chem-
ist also stock the top 12 of 
Australia’s most popular 
vitamin brands, all at dis-
counted prices.

People will also find an 
expanded pet range, weight 
loss powders and a huge 
range of superfoods, a full 

complement of skin care, 
hair care and much more.

This is the third superstore 
launch in their group and 
along with seven other stores 
it allows Your Discount 
Chemist to have better buy-
ing power, “which we pass 
straight on to our customers”. 

People can expect about 
1000 of the most popular 
pharmacy lines at everyday 
low prices.

And while prices are 
cheap, customer service is 

not compromised, with the 
staff well trained in all prod-
uct lines. 

When it comes to pre-
scriptions, Mr Khodary said 
it is his opinion that their 
prescription prices are some 
of the cheapest in Australia.

It is a family-owned busi-
ness and the Khodary broth-
ers are all very hands-on. 
They have been operating on 
the Mid North Coast for more 
than 19 years and have their 
head office here, so they are 

in tune with the local area.
They are all pharmacists 

and play their own roles 
within the group. Said is 
responsible for promotions, 
stock buying and advertis-
ing; Ibby is the day-to-day 
operations manager; Fawaz 
takes care of HR and financ-
es while Hamdy takes care 
of the website and graphic 
design work.

Why not head over to Bold 
Street this Saturday and see 
for yourself.


